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GROUP INSURANCE 
SOCIAL MEDIA POSTS

POST X(FORMERLY TWITTER) LINKEDIN / FACEBOOK VISUAL

Your workplace may offer group 
#lifeinsurance coverage, but is it 
enough to protect the people you 
love? Contact me today & let’s explore 
your options. Insert URL if applicable 
#workplacebenefits

Is your employer-provided 
#lifeinsurance enough? If you need 
additional coverage, I can help you 
find the right solution. Let’s talk today: 
Insert URL if applicable #workplace-
benefits

Your employer-provided #lifeinsurance 
coverage may not provide enough 
protection. Don’t get caught being 
underinsured. Contact me today to 
explore your options. Insert URL if 
applicable #workplacebenefits

48% of households that only have #life-
insurance through work believe they’d 
be in financial crisis in 6 months if a 
wage earner died unexpectedly, says 
LIMRA’s Insurance Barometer Study. 
Let’s discuss ways to safeguard your 
future today. Insert URL if applicable

Your workplace may offer group 
#lifeinsurance coverage, but it may not 
be enough to safeguard your future. 
Contact me today and let’s explore your 
options. #workplacebenefits Insert URL 
if applicable

Is your employer-provided 
#lifeinsurance coverage enough? If you 
think you need additional coverage, 
I can help you find the right solution. 
Let’s talk today. #workplacebenefits 
Insert URL if applicable

Alert: Your employer-provided #lifein-
surance coverage may not be providing 
enough protection. Don’t get caught 
being underinsured. Contact me today 
and let’s explore your options. 
#workplacebenefits Insert URL 
if applicable

48% of households that only have 
#lifeinsurance through work believe 
they’d be in financial crisis within 6 
months if a wage earner died unex-
pectedly, reports LIMRA’s Insurance 
Barometer Study. Let’s discuss ways to 
safeguard your future today. #workpla-
cebenefits Insert URL if applicable

1

2

3

4

This content has been approved for consumer use but, if appropriate, please ensure you are observing your agency’s social media guidelines before sending any
message. All statistics come from recent Barometer Studies LIMRA, unless otherwise indicated. The Savings Bank Mutual Life Insurance Company of 
Massachusetts, Woburn, MA. NAIC #70435. ©2023 All rights reserved. 23-4126 5/2023
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